Solicitation: IFB-19.0005 AWARDED VENDOR APAC Paper & Interboro Pyramid School |Supply Den Inc
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies Packaging Corp Packaging Products

Line Item #1 Unit Price
BOTTLE, PLASTIC, GRADUATED, W/TRIGGER SPRAYER ;

Pyramid School Products
24 OZ.
UOM: EACH S 0.78
Brand Brand
Manufacturer: Continental
Model Number: 924B & 110220 Impact
Line Item #2 Unit Price
BOTTLE, PLASTIC, GRADUATED, W/TRIGGER SPRAYER )

Pyramid School Products
32 0Z.
UOM: EACH $ 0.82
Brand Brand
Manufacturer: Continental
Model Number: 932B & 110221 Impact
Line Item #3 Unit Price
BOTTLE, SPRAYER GENERAL PURPOSE TRIGGER, WHITE X
UOM: EACH Pyramid School Products

$ 0.49
Brand Brand
Manufacturer: Impact
Model Number: 5906 Impact
Line Item #4 Unit Price
BOWL SWAB MOPS, DURALON YARN HEAD WITH X
PLASTIC HANDLE Pyramid School Products
UOM: EACH $ 0.52
Brand Brand
Manufacturer: Wilen
Model Number: 1302-02 Wilen
Line Item #5 Unit Price
BROOM, ANGULAR, SMALL 48", 7 1/2" SWEEPING
SURFACE PLASTIC FLAGGED, WITH RIBBED METAL Pyramid School Products
HANDLE, STIFF BRISTLE 9"
UOM: EACH S 3.89
Brand Brand
Manufacturer: O'Cedar
Model Number: 6404 ABCO
Line Item #6 Unit Price
BROOM, CORN WAREHOUSE 56" HD WITH 1 1/8"
HANDLE Pyramid School Products
UOM: EACH
$ 5.98
Brand Brand
Manufacturer: Abco
Model Number: BR28SE ABCO
*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021 1




Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #7
BRUSH, BENCH 8" TRIM, TAMPICO FILL
UOM: CASE

Apac Paper & Packaging Corp

Unit Price

$16.40/6/case

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: 6341

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #8

BUCKET & WRINGER, PLASTIC MOPPING COMBO PACK,
44 QUART CAPACITY, YELLOW

UOM: EACH

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

S 72.98

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: 6186-88

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #9

BUCKET, UTILITY HEAVY DUTY 10 QUART, GRAY,
MOLDED SPOUT

UOM: EACH

Apac Paper & Packaging Corp

Unit Price

$ 3.40

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: 2963

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #10

BUCKET, WAVE BRAKE COMBO 35 QUART SIDE PRESS
COMBO PACK YELLOW

UOM: EACH

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

$ 42.98

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: 7580-88

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #11
CLEANER, DISINFECTANT, FLOOR COG HDQ C2, 2 LITER
UOM: 4/CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 72.25

Brand
Manufacturer: Spartan
Model Number: 4702

Brand

Spartan

Line Item #12

CLEANER, BOWL CLEAN ACID COG NATURAL,
CONCENTRATE 1, 2 LITER

UOM: 4/CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 60.87

Brand
Manufacturer: Spartan
Model Number: 4716

Brand

Spartan

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021




Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #13
CLEANER, CLEAN BY PEROXY COG 15 2 LITER
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 79.96

Brand
Manufacturer: Spartan
Model Number: 4820

Brand

Spartan

Line Item #14
CLEANER, DEGREASER #6, ECO DEGREASER
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 46.55

Brand
Manufacturer: Spartan
Model Number: 4734

Brand

Spartan

Line Item #15
CLEANER, GERMICIDAL HP FOAMING
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 28.56

Brand
Manufacturer: Claire
Model Number: CLA 876

Brand

Claire

Line Item #16

CLEANER, MOP CLEANER, DAMP FILM FREE NEUTRAL
DETERGENT CONCENTRATE

UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 71.61

Brand
Manufacturer: Spartan
Model Number: 4736

Brand

Spartan

Line Item #17

CLEANER, NATURAL ACID BOWL CLEAN/PORCELAIN
PLUS IV

UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 38.91

Brand
Manufacturer: Spartan
Model Number: 3310-03

Brand

Spartan

Line Item #18
CLEANSER, BOWL CLEANER, SPARCREME BOTTLE 24 OZ
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 27.58

Brand
Manufacturer: Spartan
Model Number: 7320-03

Brand

Spartan

Line Item #19
CLEANSER, GLASS COG BIORENEWABLE 18, 2 LITER
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 90.95

Brand
Manufacturer: Spartan
Model Number: 4835

Brand

Spartan

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021




Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #20

CONTAINER, BRUTE 44 GALLON, GRAY WITH DOLLY
AND LIDS

UOM: EACH

Apac Paper & Packaging Corp

Unit Price

S 64.65

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: 2643,2640,2645

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #21

CONTAINER, BRUTE DOLLY ONLY FOR 2620, 2632, 2643,
2655

UOM: EACH

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

S 28.98

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: 2640

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #22
CONTAINER, BRUTE WITHOUT LID GRAY 44 GALLON
UOM: EACH

Apac Paper & Packaging Corp

Unit Price

S 25.90

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: 2643

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #23
CONTAINER, HUSKEE RECEPTACLE GRAY 32 GALLON
UOM: EACH

DUAL AWARD
Apac Paper & Packaging Corp
Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 14.75

S 15.22

Brand
Manufacturer: Continental
Model Number: 3200GY

Brand

Rubbermaid 232

Rubbermaid

Line Item #24
DUST PAN, LOBBY, 11.3 X 5 X 12.8" BLACK
UOM: EACH

Apac Paper & Packaging Corp

$ 6.65

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: 2531

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #25

DUST PAN, METAL, HEAVY DUTY- 20 GAUGE STEEL 12"
W, BLACK

UOM: EACH

Pyramid School Products

Brand
Manufacturer: Impact
Model Number: 4212

Brand

Impact

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021




Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #26

FLOOR FINISH, BEST HIGH FILM BUILD LOW
MAINTENANCE

UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 113.55

Brand
Manufacturer: Betco
Model Number: 64405-00

Brand

Betco

Line Item #27

FLOOR FINISH, HIGH GLOSS RESILIENT MUST BE
RECOMMENDED FOR USE ON VINYL ASBESTOS,
REINFORCED VINYL, ASPHALT AND TERRAZZO,
MINIMUM 18% NON-VIOLATILE SOLIDS, DETERGENT
RESISTANT, SCUFF/SLIP RESISTANT, P.H. LEVEL 8.0 -9.0
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 51.08

Brand
Manufacturer: Spartan Sunnyside
Model Number: 4045

Brand

Spartan Sunnyside

Line Item #28

FLOOR NEUTRALIZER, NEUTRALIZES SALT ON HARD
FLOORS WITHOUT DULLING FLOOR FINISH 1 PACK
MAKES 6 GALLONS

UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 48.25

Brand
Manufacturer: Stearns
Model Number: ST 729

Brand

Stearns

Line Item #29

FLOOR STRIPPER, HEAVY DUTY MUST HAVE HIGH
PERCENTAGE ACTIVE SPEED STRIPPER, LOW
FOAM,,COLD WATER ACTIVATED, MUST BE APPLICABLE
TO TILE AN DTERRAZZO, 5 GALLON PAIL

UOM: PAIL

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 60.67

Brand
Manufacturer: Spartan Shineline
Model Number: 0084-5

Brand

Spartan Shineline

Line Item #30

FLOOR STRIPPER, HEAVY DUTY WAX STRIPPER 5
GALLON CONTAINER

UOM: EACH

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 70.42

Brand
Manufacturer: Betco Extreme
Model Number: 18405-00

Brand

Betco Extreme

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021




Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #31
GLOVES, CLEANING, NITRILE, FLEECE LINED, MEDIUM
UOM: EACH

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 0.68

Brand
Manufacturer: Safety Zone
Model Number: GNGF-M-15C

Brand

Saftey Zone

Line Item #32

GLOVES, LATEX, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, SMOOTH,
LARGE

UOM: 1000/CASE

Interboro Packaging

Unit Price

S 32.90

Brand
Manufacturer: Liberty Glove
Model Number: 2810W

Brand

Alt. Aurelia-LPFG-L
Mfr: Super Max

Line Item #33

GLOVES, LATEX, DISPOSABLE, WITH POWDER,
INDUSTRIAL GRADE, LARGE

UOM: 1000/CASE

Interboro Packaging

Unit Price

$ 29.40

Brand
Manufacturer: Liberty Glove
Model Number: 2800W

Brand

Alt. First
Care/JobGuard-LG-L

Line Item #34

GLOVES, VINYL EXAM POWDER FREE MEDICAL GRADE,
LARGE/ BOX OF 100

UOM: 1000/CASE

Interboro Packaging

Unit Price

$ 23.25

Brand
Manufacturer: Med Pride
Model Number: MP 7003

Brand

Med Pride-VPFG-E-L
Mfr: Med Pride

Line Item #35

GLOVES, VINYL EXAM POWDER FREE MEDICAL GRADE,
MEDIUM / BOX OF 100

UOM: 1000/CASE

Interboro Packaging

Unit Price

S 23.25

Brand
Manufacturer: Med Pride
Model Number: MP 7002

Brand

Med Pride-VPFG-E-M
Mfr: Med Pride

Line Item #36
GUM REMOVER, FREEZE TYPE AEROSOL
UOM: CASE

DUAL AWARD
Pyramid School Products
Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 34.98

S 53.00

Brand
Manufacturer: Betco
Model Number: 00923-00

12-120z cans/case= $2.92/each

Brand

Chase

Betco

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021




Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #37

HANDLE, MOP AND FRAME FOR 24" WIDE MOP HEAD
VARNISHED HANDLE

UOM: EACH

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

$ 8.99

Brand
Manufacturer: Tuway
Model Number: SN24-5 & 01406NB

Brand

Tuway

Line Item #38

MOP, DUST, DISPOSABLE CUT & BLENDED DISPOS
TREES Il A SOFT OPEN TWIST YARN, NON TREATED, 5" X
36"

UOM: EACH

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: L155

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #39

MOP, DUST, DISPOSABLE CUT & BLENDED DISPOS
TREES Il A SOFT OPEN TWIST YARN, NON TREATED, 5" X
24"

UOM: EACH

Apac Paper & Packaging Corp

Unit Price

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: L153

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #40

MOP, HEAD, COTTON CHOICE, 1" HEADBAND, 4 PLY, 24
oz

UOM: EACH

Apac Paper & Packaging Corp

Unit Price

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: V118

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #41
MOP, SUPER STITCH BLEND MOP, WHITE, LARGE 5"
UOM: CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

$ 4.89

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: D253

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #42
MOP, TOILET BOWL DELUXE GREEN 202
UOM: EACH

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

Brand
Manufacturer: Impact
Model Number: 202

Brand

Impact

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021




Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #43

MOP, UNIVERSAL HEADBAND, BLEND LOOP, BLUE 24
oz

UOM: CASE

Apac Paper & Packaging Corp

Unit Price

S 47.50

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: E238

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #44

MOP, WEB FOOT FINISH MOP, WHITE/BLUE, MEDIUM
1

UOM: CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

$ 4.99

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: A412

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #45
MOP, WEB FOOT FINISH MOP, WHITE/BLUE, LARGE 1"
UOM: CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

S 5.89

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: A413

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #46

MOP, WET, RAYON/COTTON BLEND LOOPED-END TAIL
BANDED MOP, NO PLASTIC BAND, GREEN

UOM: CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: C112-06

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #47
PAD, BUFFER RED 14"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 10.65

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M NIAGARA
Model Number: 61-5000-4492-2

Brand

3M Niagara

Line Item #48
PAD, BUFFER RED 16"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 12.71

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M NIAGARA
Model Number: 61-5000-4494-8

Brand

3M Niagara

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021




Solicitation: IFB-19.0005

2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #49
PAD, BUFFING RED, LIGHT ABRASIVE, 20"
UOM: BOX

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 18.07

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M NIAGARA
Model Number: 5100-20

Brand

3M Niagara

Line Item #50
PAD, CLEANER BLUE 14"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 10.65

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M NIAGARA
Model Number: 61-5000-4472-4

Brand

3M Niagara

Line Item #51
PAD, CLEANER BLUE 20"
UOM: CASE

DUAL AWARD
Pyramid School Products
Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 17.99

S 18.07

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M NIAGARA
Model Number: 61-5000-4478-1

Brand

ACS

3M Niagara

Line Item #52

UOM: CASE

PAD, DOODLEBUG PAD, SCRUB, GREEN, 6/PKS OF 10

DUAL AWARD
Pyramid School Products
Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 11.99

$ 29.11

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 70071593373

Brand

ACS

3M

Line Item #53
PAD, DUST MICROFIBER, HEAVY-DUTY 24"
UOM: CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

$ 44.28

Brand
Manufacturer: Tuway
Model Number: MFG 24FR

Brand

Monarch

Line Item #54
PAD, DUST MICROFIBER, HEAVY-DUTY 48"
UOM: CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

$ 61.68

Brand
Manufacturer: Tuway
Model Number: MFG 48FR

Brand

Monarch

Line Item #55
PAD, DUST MICROFIBER, HEAVY-DUTY 18"
UOM: CASE

DUAL
Apac Paper & Packaging Corp
Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

S 82.30

S 41.88

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: Q412

Brand

Rubbermaid

Monarch

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021




Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #56
PAD, DUST MICROFIBER, HEAVY-DUTY 36"
UOM: CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

S 57.48

Brand
Manufacturer: Tuway
Model Number: MFG 36FR

Brand

Monarch

Line Item #57
PAD, EASY ERASING NO. 4004, 3 PER CASE/4 PER BAG
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 42.54

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 70-0712-8392-6

Brand

3M

Line Item #58
PAD, HI-SPEED 20" NATURAL BLEND TAN
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 26.77

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 70-0705-0209-4

Brand

3M

Line Item #59

PAD, SCOURING HD SCOUR PAD 86, 6X9 12/BOX, 3
BOXES/CASE

UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 45.84

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 61-5000-2592-1

Brand

3M

Line Item #60
PAD, SCOURING, GREEN 6" X 9" 20/CASE
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 29.11

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 70-071-5924-09

Brand

3M

Line Item #61

PAD, SCOURING, MEDIUM DUTY, GREEN, 20/BOX, 3
BOXES/CASE 6" X 9"

UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 29.11

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 70-071-15923-83

Brand

3M

Line Item #62
PAD, SCRUBBER, BLUE 20"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 18.07

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 8413

Brand

3M

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021

10




Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #63
PAD, SCRUBBER, GREEN 17"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 14.88

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M-NIAGARA
Model Number: 70-0711-6543-8

Brand

3M Niagara

Line Item #64
PAD, STRIPPING BLACK 13"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 14.39

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 61-5000-4437-7

Brand

3M

Line Item #65
PAD, STRIPPING BLACK 14"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 16.37

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 61-5000-4438-5

Brand

3M

Line Item #66
PAD, STRIPPING BLACK 16"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 19.17

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 61-5000-4440-1

Brand

3M

Line Item #67
PAD, STRIPPING BLACK 19"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 25.25

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 61-5000-4442-7

Brand

3M

Line Item #68
PAD, STRIPPING BLACK 20"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 27.50

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 61-5000-3592-0

Brand

3M

Line Item #69

5/CASE
UOM: CASE

PAD, STRIPPING HIGH FOR WET STRIPPING FLOOR, 20",

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 51.36

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 8278

Brand

3M

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021
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Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #70
PAD, STRIPPING, BLACK 12"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 15.39

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 70-0708-4261-5

Brand

3M

Line Item #71
PAD, STRIPPING, BLACK 20"
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 27.50

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M
Model Number: 61-5000-3592-0

Brand

3M

Line Item #72
PAD, STRIPPING, HI-PRO 20"
UOM: EACH

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 24.06

Brand
Manufacturer: 3M-Niagra
Model Number: 35014

Brand

3M Niagara

Line Item #73
PAN, DUST LOBBYPRO UPRIGHT BLACK
UOM: EACH

Apac Paper & Packaging Corp

Unit Price

S 6.65

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: 2531

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #74

SCRAPER BLADES, REPLACEMENT FOR LONG HANDLE
SCRAPERS 4" 6 PER CASE

UOM: PACK

DUAL AWARD
Pyramid School Products
Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 5.99

$ 6.26

Brand
Manufacturer: Ettore
Model Number: 20291

Pack of 10

Brand

Bebler Brush

Unger

Line Item #75
SCRAPER, ETTORE POCKET METAL CASE
UOM: EACH

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 1.03

Brand
Manufacturer: Ettore
Model Number: 4286

Brand

Unger

Line Item #76

SCRAPER, LONG HANDLE 48" HANDLE WITH RUBBER
GRIP AND 4" RAZOR SHARP BLADE 6/CASE

UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 43.96

Brand
Manufacturer: Ettore
Model Number: 2007

Brand

Ettore

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021
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Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #77

SOAP, HAND LITE'N FOAMY SUNFLOWER FRESH 4/CASE
GALLON

UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 27.17

Brand
Manufacturer: Spartan
Model Number: 3305

Brand

Spartan

Line Item #78
SOAP, HAND SANITIZER REFILL 1200 ML 2/CASE
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 63.47

Brand
Manufacturer: Gojo
Model Number: 5392-02

Brand

Gojo

Line Item #79
SOAP, HAND SANITIZER FOAM REFILL, 1200 ML 3/CASE
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 69.12

Brand
Manufacturer: Gojo
Model Number: 5192-03

Brand

Gojo

Line Item #80
SOAP, PAIL PUMP FOR 1 OUNCE 5 GALLON PAIL
UOM: EACH

DUAL AWARD
Pyramid School Products
Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 2.99

$ 3.05

Brand
Manufacturer: Impact
Model Number: 901A

Brand

Tolco

Impact

Line Item #81
SPONGE, CELLULOSE 4 1/2" x 3" x 11/16"
UOM: EACH

Unit Price

Brand
Manufacturer: Hydra Sponge
Model Number: W1PK

Brand

Hydra Sponge

Line Item #82

WASTEBASKET, SOFT, 41 1/4 QUART LIST WHAT
COLORS ARE AVAILABLE.

UOM: EACH

Unit Price

Brand
Manufacturer: Rubbermaid
Model Number: 2957

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #83

DUSTMOP, CASTAWAY BLENDED CUT-END DISPOSABLE
5x 60, WHITE 12/CASE

UOM: CASE

Unit Price

$ 82.68

Brand
Manufacturer: RUBBERMAID
Model Number: L-158

Brand

Rubbermaid

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021
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Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #84
MOPHEAD, SWINGER, LOPED LARGE 1" BLUE 6/CASE
UOM: CASE

Unit Price

$ 30.06

Brand
Manufacturer: RUBBERMAID
Model Number: RM C113

Brand

Rubbermaid

Line Item #85
SOAP, HAND, BULK, FOAMING PEARLUX GALLON
UOM: GALLON

Unit Price

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Line Item #86

DISPENSER FOR HAND SOAP. PLEASE INDICATE WHAT
THE CONTRACT TERMS WILL BE FOR THE DISPENSERS.
PLEASE SPECIFY COLORS ARE AVAILABLE.

UOM: EACH

Unit Price

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Line Item #87
Ice Melt
UOM: 50Ib BAG

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 8.42

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable - To be delivered in a 24-48
hour window

Brand

Powermelt

Line Item #88
PH7Q Neutral Disinfectant
UOM: 5 GALLON PAIL

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 49.31

Brand
Betco Product

Brand

Betco

Line Item #89
PH7Q Neutral Disinfectant
UOM: 55 GALLON DRUM

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 371.70

Brand
Betco Product

Brand

Betco

Line Item #90
PH7 Daily Floor Cleaner
UOM: 55 GALLON DRUM

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 238.15

Brand
Betco Product

Brand

Betco

Line Item #91
Ax-It Plus Floor Stripper
UOM: 5 GALLON PAIL

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 52.91

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Betco

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021
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Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #92
Glare Floor Finish Acrylic
UOM: 5 GALLON PAIL

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 51.09

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Betco

Line Item #93
Glare Floor Finish Acrylic
UOM: 55 GALLON DRUM

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 511.68

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Betco

Line Item #94
AC114 Multi-Purpose Acid Cleaner 4/1G
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 26.15

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Betco

Line Item #95
Upset Absorbent
UOM: 10/2LB.

DUAL AWARD

Apac Paper & Packaging Corp

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 61.00

$ 55.30

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Arrow

Line Item #96
Coded Trigger -Spray Bottle
UOM: EACH

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 1.25

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Impact

Line Item #97
Coded Trigger-Spray Bottle
UOM: CARTON

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 1.25

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Impact

Line Item #98
Symmetry Hair & Body Wash, Foam wash, 1250 mL
UOM: CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 40.45

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Kutol

Line Item #99
Symmetry Hair & Body Wash, Foam wash, 2000 mL
UOM: CASE

Unit Price

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Line Item #100
Glass Cleaner
UOM: 4/1 gallon

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 21.91

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Power

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021
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Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #101
Multiple Carpet Runner, 36 x 120, Clear
UOM: EACH

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 773.18

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Dimex

Line Item #102
Carpet Runner, 36 X 240, Clear
UOM: EACH

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 1,541.36

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Dimex

Line Item #103
Sensor/VSP Vacuum Bags
UOM: 10BAGS/PK, 25PK/CASE

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 15.90

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Versamatic

Line Item #104
30-45 Telescopic Duster Lambswool
UOM: 12 EACH/CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

$ 55.08

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Lambskin

Line Item #105
Ant Traps
UOM: 12/6pks/case

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 52.50

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Combat

Line Item #106
CLP12 Clipper Carpet Extractor
UOM: EACH

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 3,335.00

Brand
Windsor

Brand

Windser

Line Item #107
2846 Exhaust Filter for S12
uoMm:

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 5.69

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Windser

Line Item #108
5301 Sensor Intake Filter
uoMm:

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

$ 3.01

Brand
Windsor

Brand

Windser

Line Item #109
5010 Brush Roller/Sensor
Uom:

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 3.57

Brand
Windsor

Brand

Windser

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021
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Solicitation: IFB-19.0005
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies

AWARDED VENDOR

APAC Paper &
Packaging Corp

Interboro
Packaging

Pyramid School
Products

Supply Den Inc

Line Item #110
Trigger Spray Standard
UOM: 250 CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

S 115.00

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Impact

Line Item #111
24 oz. Wet Mop White Cut, End Cotton, 1.25"
UOM: 12/CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

S 28.68

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

ABCO

Line Item #112
32 OZ. Plastic Bottle w/Graduations
UOM: 96/CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

S 47.04

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Impact

Line Item #113
6 QT. Utility Pails
UOM: 48/CASE

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

$ 129.12

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Greenwood

Line Item #114
7200 20" Black Stripping Floor Pad
UOM: 5/CASE

Unit Price

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Line Item #115
Tough on Grease N.B
UOM: 4 gal/case

Unit Price

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

Line Item #116
12" Brass Window Squeege
UOM: 10/CT

Supply Den Inc

Unit Price

S 29.90

S 137.35

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

ABCO 12" Steel

Unger

Line Item #117
Toilet Bowl Mop
UOM: 100/case

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

S 49.00

Brand
Duralon

Brand

Tolco

Line Item #118
8541 Doodlebug Pad BRN
UOM: 4 - 5/8x10, 5/BX, 4BX/Case

Pyramid School Products

Unit Price

S 11.98

Brand
All Brands are Acceptable

Brand

ACS

*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021
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Solicitation: IFB-19.0005 AWARDED VENDOR APAC Paper & Interboro Pyramid School |Supply Den Inc
2020-2021 OCSPO Custodial Supplies Packaging Corp Packaging Products
Line Item #119 Unit Price
Pad Holder, Swivel w/Threaded Sockets
UOM: 12/case Pyramid School Products S 59.76
Brand Brand
All Brands are Acceptable Tolco
Line Item #120 Unit Price
6"x9" Hand Pad Med Duty
UOM: 20/CASE Supply Den Inc $ 2.86
Brand Brand
All Brands are Acceptable 3M
Line Item #121 Unit Price
Lift Off #2 Adhesive Remover
UOM: 6-22 0z/CASE Supply Den Inc S 65.11
Brand Brand
All Brands are Acceptable Core
Line Item #122 Unit Price
Foam Hand Soap
UOM: 4/CASE Supply Den Inc S 27.18
Brand Brand
All Brands are Acceptable Kutol
Line Item #123 Unit Price
Fem Napkin Waxed Bag F/Wallmount Unit
UOM: 500/CASE Pyramid School Products S 14.98
Brand Brand
All Brands are Acceptable Hospeco
Line Item #124 Unit Price
Sanitary Napkin Dispenser
UOM: 12/CASE Supply Den Inc S 2,100.48
Brand Brand
All Brands are Acceptable Impact
Line Item #125 Unit Price
Pinky toilet bowl, tile, porc cleaner 20% Phos
UOM: 12/CASE Supply Den Inc S 29.24
Brand Brand
All Brands are Acceptable Power
Line Item #126 Unit Price
Chewing Gum Remover
UOM: 12 o0z. 12cn/CASE Supply Den Inc S 23.04
Brand Brand
All Brands are Acceptable Spray Pak
*Pricing is firm 3/1/2020 - 2/28/2021 18




